
CARPORT FEATURES:

EASIER CONFIGURATIONS 
From 2 to 10 vehicles per array, 
configuring for your space is handled 
by our online design tool. Our team is 
happy assist you with design services. 

PATENTED HOISTING SYSTEM 
Install racking and modules at ground 
level, then raise array to eye level for 
wiring, and finally to the top of the 
pole for completion. Chain hoist and 
lifting bracket required. 

RUGGED DESIGN 
Built for high wind and high snow 
loads when necessary. Use our online 
calculator to determine pole size and 
frame duty suitable for your site. 

ENGINEERING ASSISTANCE 
Complimentary in-house design help 
with live engineering checks. Stamped 
drawings are available for all 50 states 
at an additional cost.

TILT ADJUSTMENT 
Tilt changes are a snap with our 
patented hand-crank adjustable tilt 
mechanism. This makes for easy 
cleaning or snow removal. Easily tilts 
from 5-90 degrees while standing on 
the ground.

GUTTERS 
We recommend contacting a local 
installer for a seamless gutter.

PRODUCT WARRANTY 
10 years

MADE IN USA 
Made in the USA with American Steel. 
Montana is not only the namesake  
of our company, it’s where we build  
your mounts. 

SOLAR CARPORT 
A DUAL PURPOSE SOLAR STRUCTURE

*POLES NOT INCLUDED

CONFIGURATION OPTIONS
Covered Parking up to 10 vehicles per array

Module Sizes any, design based on module size

Front Edge Clearance 7 ft. - 20 ft.

Tilt 5°- 30°

Pole Sizes NPS 6 in., 8 in., 10 in.

Pole Spacing 15 ft.., 17 ft.., 19.75 ft., 22.5 ft.
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NORTH / SOUTH PARKING - UP TO 10 VEHICLES EAST / WEST PARKING - 2 VEHICLES

SOLAR CARPORT


